-5

IN ACCQUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLP

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
PATENT AND TRADE-MARK AGENTS
3UTH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
30 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITORA RIC 4G1

TELEPHONE (204)337-0050
Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway April 11, 2005
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474
Invoice 448512

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the period of February
25, 2005 to April 08, 2005 including:

DATE INIT DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE HOURS

25 Feb 05 MSM Teleconference with R. Ridd; 0.40
call to East St. Paul Police

01 Mar05 MSM  Telephone from J. Poole; 0.40
telephone to and from B.
Kaplan; mail to J, Poole

01 Mar05 MSM  Telephone to and from East St. 0.20
Paul Police, Mar 30 05 10am
in 301; call to J. Poole

02Mar 05 MSM-  Mail to B. Kaplan re update 0.30
and call from J. Poole, email
to and from B. Kaplan

04 Mar 05 MSM Review file from East St. 1.00
Paul Police and call to J.
Poole
07 Mar 05 MSM Call from J. Poole - WPS PSU 0.20
17 Mar 05 MSM Call from K. Bueti and call 0.20

to Brian Kaplan

17Mar 05 MSM Call from B. Kaplan, call 0.40
from and to East St. Paul
Police, letter to R. Wolson

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rates established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to time; in some cases they may exoeed
amourts we pay 10 third panies. A schedule of these rawes is avallable oa request.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, l'NTER.E.ST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 7% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.28




2

DATE INIT DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE HOURS
29 Mar 05 MSM  Call from R. Wolson 0.20
29 Mar 05  MSM Call to R. Wolson 0.10
30 Mar 05  MSM Calls to Jim Poole WPS - PSU 0.80
re disclosure package and :
call from J. Poole. Attend
new law courts building in a.
m. and meet with counsel,
attend on remand
06 Apr 05 MSM Mail to WPS - PSU re status 0.10
of investigation
07 Apr05  MSM Telephone call to and from J. 0.20
Poole
Total Hours 4.50

3401.29




"IN ACCQUNT WITH
AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON Lvrp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
3TH FLOOR COMMODRITY EXCHANGE TOWER
30 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA R3C 4G1

TELEPHONE (204)957-0050
Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan

September 22, 2005

File No. 0501474
Invoice 456363

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk

| TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the period of April 26,
2005 to September 22, 2005 including:

- DATE INIT DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE HOURS
| 26 Apr05 MSM  Callt to WPS - re disclosure 0.20
26 Apr 05 MSM Meet with PSU Investigator 0.30
and obtain further disclosure,
discussion re CD and
transcripts
27 Apr 05 MSM Review written report from 1.60

WPS - PSU, discussion with R.
Wolson and attend court for

remand
03 May 05 MSM Prep disclosure inventory 1.00
05 May 05 MSM Letter to R. Wolson 0.10
24 May 05 MSM Call to PIC trial coordinator 0.10
25May 05 MSM  Call to PJC trial coordinator 0.20

and call to Barb McKean

26 May 05 MSM  Call to Z. Tessler re case 0.10
list on drunk driving cases

26 May 05 MSM Call to C. Ireton re 0.10
obtaining trial dates

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rates established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaldsen LLF and may change [rom lime (o time; in some cascs they may exceed

amounts we gay \o third panies. A scheduie of these rates is avallable on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

- IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 7% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT 1S ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.30



INIT

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE HQURS
27 May 05 MSM Call to C. Ireton and mail to 0.20
R. Wolson
30 May 05 MSM Mail to R. Wolson re prelim 0.10
date
31 May 05 MSM Email from R. Wolson 0.10
31 May 05 MSM Email to C. Ireton to confirm 0.10
use of dates
31 May 05 MSM Telephone call with D. Slough 0.10
31 May 05 MSM Attend court to set prelim 0.20
date and pre-trial
Ol Sep 05 MSM Review accident reports and 1.00
call to Cst. Blackmore at
RCMP Traffic Analysis
Total Hours 5.50

3401.31




IN ACCC.UNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICTTORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
MTH FLOOR COMMOMATY EXCHANGE TOWER
MO MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA RIC 4G

TELEPHONE {204)957-0030
Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division

510 - 405 Broadway December 05, 2005
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474

Invoice 460356
GST REGISTRATION NUM!EI I.IIMGTS'I!

RE: Zenk
Qur File No: 0501474/MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from September 22, 2005 to and including
December 02, 2005 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
22 Sep 05 Review letter from Crown MSM 1.00

" office and teleconference
with B. Kaplan

26 Sep 05 Email to B. Kaplan MSM 0.10
28 Sep 05 Call to MPI re ministerial MSM 0.50

correspondence, call from
deceased’s family, call to B.

Kaplan
03 Oct 05 Review file and meet with MSM 3.00
deceased’s parent
31 Oct 05 Telephone call with C. Ireton MSM 0.30
07 Nov 05  Call to and from WPS MSM 0.20
Total Hours 5.10
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 5.10 hrs.

3401.32



. . IN ACCOUNT WITH

AIKINS MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
MNTH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
360 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITORA R3C 4G

TELEPHONE {204)957-0050
' Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Divisiq e e e
510 - 405 Broadway BB 3 January 27, 2006
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6 Uﬂv&iw_ Voo
Attention: Brian Kaplan--—"-.__ N ' ; File No. 0501474
\)/ JAH 31 208 : Invoice 463701
b, ) GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R12145747%
{ Justic:
RE: Zenk Dé K%N@Y‘i&/g PROSEGUTIUo ‘
Our File No: 0501474/MSM ADMINISTRATION |

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from December 16, 2005 to and including
January 27, 2006 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

16 Dec 05  Email from Crown’s office re MSM 3.00
pre-trial memo to Provincial '
Judges Court, review file and
preparation for pre-trial

hearing
19 Dec 05  Attend for pre-trial MSM 1.20
conference, letter to E. St.
Paul Police
14 Jan 06 Letter from PJC Meyers re MSM 0.10
pretial issues
18 Jan 06 Call from R. Wolson MSM 0.20
23 Jan 06 Call from and to PJ Meyers re MSM 0.20
pre-trial
Total Hours 4.70
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 4 .70 hrs.

3401.33




IN ACCOUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON Lrp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
¥ITH FLOOR COMMOIITY EXCHANGE TOWER
M0 MAIN STREET
© WINNIPEG, MANITOBA R3IC 4G

TELEPHONE (204)957-0050

Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway

Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6

Attention: Brian Kaplan

May 29, 2006

File No. 0501474
Invoice 470999

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R 121167573

RE: Zenk . ‘O 6 e
Our File No: 0501474/MS

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from February 10, 2006 to and including
May 29, 2006 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

10 Feb 06 Call from Sgt. N. Carter of MSM 0.20
East St. Paul Police

13 Feb 06  Teleconference with N. Carter MSM 0.20
of East St. Paul Police

16 Feb 06 Review file for meeting with MSM 1.00
Norm Carter of East St. Paul
Police

17 Feb 06 Telephone calls from and to MSM 0.20
Norm Carter of East St. Paul
Police

20 Feb 06 Telephone call from East St. MSM 0.10
Paul Police

21 Feb 06 Teleconference with N. Carter MSM 0.20
of East St. Paul Police

24 Feb 06 Meeting with Norm Carter MSM 1.50

27 Feb 06 Review further disclosure MSM 2.50

(reports, statements and

“Service and Other Charges® are based on raics established by Aiking, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to time; in some cases they may cxceed
amounts we pay Lo third parties. A schedule of these rales s available on request.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 8% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT 15 DELIVERED.

3401.34



issues for meeting with RCMP
and trial, meeting at D
Division, call to B. Kaplan's
office

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
traffic analyst opinion)
received from East St. Paul
Police
08 Apr 06  Review file, call to East St. MSM 2.00
Paul Police, prepare witness
list for prelim, email to C.O.
P. Carter with witness list
18 Apr 06  Call to A. Erb to call East MSM 0.10
St. Paul Police re witness
list
21 Apr 06  Meeting with Chief of East St. MSM 1.00
Paul Police Norm Carter and
teleconference with B. Kaplan
26 Apr06  Review report from Chief Norm MSM 0.30
Carter
27 Apr 06  Telephone call to B. Kaplan MSM 0.10
‘ re Chief Norm Carter’s report
02 May 06  Meeting with B. Kaplan MSM 1.00
03 May 06  Meet with father of deceased MSM 1.00
and son and witness
representative
09 May 06  Call to Mike Horn MSM 0.10
10 May 06  Call from M. Horn MSM 0.20
12 May 06  Call from and to Sean Black MSM 0.30
12 May 66  Call from RCMP and call to MSM 0.30
RCMP
15May 06 Review police file, identify MSM 5.50

“Service and Other Charges® are based on rates established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to time; in some cases they may exceed
amounts we pay to third parties. A schedule of these rates s available on request.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

[N ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 8% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THI§S STATEMENT IS DELIVERED-

3401.35




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

16 May 06  Call from C. Ireton re meeting MSM 0.20

16 May 06  Telephone call from and to C. MSM 0.20

‘ Blandford, emails from and to

C. Blandford

16 May 06  Telephone call from Chris MSM 0.60
Blandford and file memo

17 May 06  Call from R, Wolsen and C. MSM 0.20
Blandford

18 May 06  Prepare for meeting, meeting MSM 2.00
with B. Kaplan and G. Lawlor,
letter to R. Wolsen

18 May 06  Telephone call to R. Wolsen MSM 0.10

23 May 06  Call from and to Chief Norm MSM 0.20
Carter

23 May 06  Call to C. Ireton re bring MSM 0.30
forward date and letter to R.
Wolsen

24 May 06  Telephone call from R. Wolson MSM 0.20
and telephone call to B.
Kaplan, email to B. Kaplan
and G. Lawlor

24 May 06  Call from and email to C. MSM 0.20
Blandford (RCMP expert)

25 May 06  Meeting with deceased’s MSM 0.50
parents

25 May 06  Call from and to Chief N. MSM 0.30
Carter

25 May 06  Meeting with family EEM 0.50

26 May 06  Emails from and to Victim MSM 0.30

Services

“Service and Other C?mges" are based on rates established by Alking, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to time In some cases they may exceed
amounts we pay 0 third parties. A schedule of these rates Is avallable on equest.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 8% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.36




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
26 May 06  Telephone call from T. Kennet, MSM __0.10
RCMP ‘
Total Hours 23.70
OUR FEE:
Plus 7% PST
TOTAL FEES:
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 23.20 hrs.
McNeil, Erin E. Associate 0.50 hrs.

3401.37




IN ACCOUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLP

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
~ TRADE-MARK AGENTS
30TH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWLR
360 MAIN STREET '
WINNIFEG. MANITOBA RIC 4G1

TELEPHONE {204;957-0050
Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan

July 17, 2006

File No. 0501474
Invoice 473194

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk
Qur File No: 0501474/MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from May 29, 2006 to and including July
- 17, 2006 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

29 May 06  Telephone call to T. Kennet : MSM 0.50
to discuss status of
investigation

29 May 06  Telephone calls to H. Reas MSM 0.20
and R. Wolsen

29 May 06  Telephone call from B. MSM 0.20
Chairokow

29 May 06  Meet with Victim Services MSM 1.50

Worker and Robert Taman
(deceased’s husband)

29 May 06 Attend meeting with victim's EEM 1.50
husband, review file

30 May 06 Attend court in a.m. on MSM 0.80
remand, call 1o B. Schartkow

31 May 06  Telephone call with T. Kennet MSM 2.00
(RCMP), prepare for and
meeting with Mr. and Mrs.
Sveinson

"Service and Other Charges™ are based on rates established by Aiking, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to lime, wn some cases they may exceed

mounts we pay 1o third partics. A schedule of these sates s available on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA. INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 8% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS. CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT 1S DELIVERED,

3401.38




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

3] May 06  Call from and to Chief Norm MSM 0.20
Carter, call from Bev
Scharikow, call to B. Kaplan

31 May 06  Meeting with family, review EEM 2.00
statements

01 Jun 06 Telephone call from B. Vogen MSM 0.40

(WPS-PSU), telephone call
from Chief Norm Carter,
prepare and fax and email
list of witnesses to cancel

01 Jun 06 Mail from WPS-PSU re MSM 0.10
cancellations

02 Jun 06 Correspondence from WPS MSM 0.10
witness

13 Jun 06 Review file and telephone MSM 1.50

call to RCMP investigator to
obtain status report, attend
court for remand

16 Jun 06 Telephone call from RCMP MSM 0.20
19 Jun 06 Telephone call from H. MSM 0.20
Weinstein
20 Jun 06 Telephone call to RCMP MSM 0.40
' investigator
26 Jun 06 Telephone call from and to MSM 0.30

Sveinson family
27 Jun 06 Telephone call to Doug Abra MSM 0.10

27 Jun 06 Attend court for remand, MSM 1.00
calls with R. Wolson'’s office,
call to H. Reay

27 Jun 06 Telephone call to and from D. MSM 0.20
Abra

"Service and Other Charges” are based on raies established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvakison LLP and may change from time 1o (ime; in some cases they may exceed

amounts we pay Lo third panies. A schedule of these rates 18 available an request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA. INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 8% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.39




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
29 Jun 06 Telephone call to Eilleen MSM 0.60
O’Donnell , telephone call to
RCMP
11 Jul 06 Email and telephone MSM 0.20
discussion with C. Ireton
11 Jul 06 Telephone call to H. Reay MSM 0.10
11 Jul 06 Attend court for remand MSM 0.50
11 Jul 06 Review RCMP correspondence MSM 0.70
Total Hours 15.50
"OUR FEE:
Plus 7% PST
TOTAL FEES:
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 12.00 hrs.
McNeil, Erin E. Associate 3.50 hrs.

3401.40




IN ACCOUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
3ITH FLOOR COGMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
360 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG. MANITOBA RIC 4G1

TELEPHONE (104)957-0050

Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway February 26, 2007

Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474
Invoice 485253

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk
Our File No: 0501474/ MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from August 15, 2006 to and including
February 26, 2007 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

15 Aug 06  Attend court on remand and MSM 1.00
setting of date

21 Aug 06  Telephone call from R. Wolson MSM 0.10

21 Aug 06  Telephone call to H. Reay, MSM 0.30
telephone call to Crowns
Office re dates

22 Aug 06  Appear to set preliminary JBM 1.30
inquiry dates

23 Aug 06  Email from and to R. Wolson MSM 0.20
and trial co-ordinator

08 Sep 06 Telephone call from S. MSM 0.10
Sveinson re hearing date

11 Sep 06 Email from J. Dyson MSM 0.10

13 Sep 06  Email from Jackie Dyson MSM 0.10

14 Dec 06 Review file for pre-trial MSM 1.00

15 Dec 06  Attend court for pre-trial MSM 1.00

“Service and Other Charges™ are based on rates established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time to ume; u\ some cases they may ¢xceed

amounts we pay 1o third parlies. A schedule of these raies is available on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT 1S DELIVERED

3401.41




2
DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
79 Dec 06  Scan disclosure for review MSM 1.00
and release
05 Feb 07  Email from and to B. Kaplan MSM 0.20
05 Feb 07 Telepbone calt to B. Kaplan MSM 0.10
14 Feb 07  Telephone call with Doug Abra MSM 0.50
15 Feb 07 Teelphone call with Doug Abra MSM 0.40
re Beaudry decision
21 Feb 07 Review Harry Bakema file MSM 2.00
statements for release on
Zenk prosecution
Total Hours 9.40
OUR FEE:
Plus 7% PST
TOTAL FEES:
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 8.10 hrs.
Martens, John B Associate 1.30 hrs.

3401.42




IN ACCQUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON Lvrp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
3TH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
360 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANTTOBA R3IC 4G1

TELEPHONE (204)357-0050
Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway June 22, 2007
Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474
Invoice 491262
GST REGISTRATION NUMBER RI12146757%
RE: Zenk

Our File No: 0501474/MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from March 08, 2007 to and including
June 22, 2007 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
08 Mar 07  Disclosure letter to R. Wolson MSM 0.30
08 May 07  Review of witness interviews, MSM 4.00

telephone call with B. Kaplan,
letter to R. Wolson

22 May 07  Review file of RCMP - MSM 1.50
additional reports to prepare
witness list, telephone call
to T. Kennet

23 May 07  Telephone call with RCMP re MSM 0.20
witness list preparation

28 May 07  Telephone call to Tracey MSM 0.50
Kennet, revise witness list
and forward to C. Ireton

04 Jun 07 Telephone call from C. MSM 0.20
Blandford, email to C.
Blandford
14 Jun Q7 Calls with Dr. Balachandra MSM 0.30
14 Jun 07 Calls with Richard Wolson MSM 0.20

"Service and Other Charges™ are based on rates established by Aikina, MacAulay & Thorvakison LLP and may change from Lime 1o time; in some cases they may exceed
amounis we pay io third partics. A schedule of these rates is availabie on request.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT 1S ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT 1§ DELIVERED.

3401.43



7.20

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
Total Hours

OUR FEE:

Plus 7% PST

TOTAL FEES:

Minuk, Martin S. Partner 7.20 hrs.

3401 .44




IN ACCQUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLp

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITORS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
MTH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
360 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITQBA R3C 4G

TELEPHONE (204)%57-0030

Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway September 28, 2007

Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474
Invoice 495717

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk
Qur File No: 0501474/ MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES readered from June 25, 2007 to and including
September 24, 2007 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
25 Jun 07 Telephone calls with MSM 0.40
witnesses and preparation for
prelim
26 Jun 07 Telephone call to Mr. Sveinson MSM 0.10
26 Jun 07 Preparation for prelim MSM 1.00
09 Jul 07 Telephone call from R. Harding MSM 0.10
(9 Jul 07 Telephone call from P. Kloos MSM 0.10
09 Jul 07 Preparation for preliminary MSM 6.00
inquiry
10 Jul 07 Preparation for preliminary ' MSM 7.00
inquiry and meeting with
Richard Wolson
10 Jul 07 Preparation of Prelim KEF 2.00
11 Jul 07 Meeting with Sean Black, . MSM 0.80

telephone call to J. Anderson

11 Jul 07 Telephone call from Richard MSM 8.00
Wolson re police statements

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rases established by Alkins, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from Lime 10 time: in some cases they may exceed

amounts we pay io third parties. A schedule of these raies is available on request.

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA. INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM

ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED

3401.45




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

and email statements to
Richard Wolson, preparation
for prelim

12 Jul 07 Meeting with Chief Carter, MSM 1.70
letter to Richard Wolson,
telephone calls from R.
Harding and C. Humniski

12 Jul 07 Telephone call with Richard MSM 0.30
Wolson

12 Jul 07 Review of sentencing cases MSM 2.00

13 Jul 07 Meeting with B. Kaplan MSM 0.80

13 Jul 07 Meeting with Robert Taman MSM 1.00

13 Jul 07 Meeting with Chris Humniski MSM 0.50

13 Jul 07 Preparation for hearing, MSM 2.00

numerous discussions with
Richard Wolson, discussions
with B. Kaplan

15 Jul 07 Calls with R. Wolson, calls MSM 1.30
with East St. Paul Police,
email to B. Kaplan

16 Jul 07 Attend court for prelim, MSM 2.50
calls with Robert Taman,
calls with Leslie McCorrister,
calls with Sveinson family

17 Jul 07 Attend court for hearing - MSM 1.50
plea entered and remand for
sentencing

17 Jul 07 Telephone call from and to MSM 0.30
RCMP Chris Blandford

07 Aug 07  Calls with R. Wolson, email MSM 0.30
to Trial Co-Ord re sentencing
dates

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rates established by Aikins. MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from tUme to time: in some cases they may exceed

amounts we pay 10 third parties. A scheduie of these raies is available on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SGCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS. CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT 1S ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED

3401.46




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

08 Aug 07  Email from J. Dyson MSM 0.10
09 Aug 07  Telephone call from R. Wolsen MSM 0.10
13 Aug 07  Emails re sentencing and MSM 0.30

Victim Impact Statements

15 Aug 07  Research and prepare Case MSM 5.00
Book for sentencing hearing,
telephone call from and to M.
Dyck of Victim Services,
review Victim Impact

Statements
16 Aug 07  Prepare for sentencing hearing MSM 4.00
17 Aug 07  Prepare final version of MSM 3.50

Sentencing Book of
Authorities and delivery of
letter and documents to Court
and R. Wolson, further
preparation for sentencing

hearing

21 Aug 07  Review file / prepare for MSM 5.00
sentencing hearing

22 Aug 07  Attend court for sentencing MSM 4.50
hearing

31 Aug 07  Telephone call from R. Wolson, MSM 1.00

letter from court, calls
with B. Kaplan

03 Sep 07 Research of sentencing issues, MSM 5.00
emails, calls with B. Kaplan

04 Sep 07 Meeting with B. Kaplan and D. MSM 1.80
Slough and research for
hearing

"Service and Other Charges™ are based on raies established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLF and may change from time 10 time: in some cases they may exceed

amounis we pay Lo third parties. A schedule of these rates is available on request
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.47



DATE

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE

INITIAL

HOURS

04 Sep 07

04 Sep 07

05 Sep 07

05 Sep 07

06 Sep 07

06 Sep 07

10 Sep 07

10 Sep 07

12 Sep 07

12 Sep 07

19 Sep 07

20 Sep 07

Letter to Sveinson and Taman
families re further
sentencing hearing date

[nstructions from Marty Minuk,
library and internet research

library and internet research,
memo to MSM, conference with
and e-mail correspondence to
MSM

Attend court in a.m. on
remand to schedule
continuation

Preparation for further
sentencing submission

Telephone call from PJC re
scheduling

Attend meeting with P.J.
Wyant and R. Wolson

Finalize sentencing
submission and case
authorities

Attend court on sentencing
hearing and calls with B.
Kaplan

attend sentencing hearing,
conference with MSM

Draft memo in reply to
request from Don Slough,
telephone calls with Don
Slough

Telephone calls with B.
Kaplan and D. Slough

MSM

EEM

EEM

MSM

MSM

MSM

MSM

MSM

MSM

EEM

MSM

MSM

0.20

2.40

0.50

1.00

0.20

1.00

5.00

5.00

3.70

2.00

0.30

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rates established by Aikins. MacAulay & Thorvaldson LLP and may change from time [o time: in some cases they may exceed

amounts we pay 1o third parties. A schedule of these rates is available on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA. INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES, CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS, CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELJVERED.

3401.48




INITIAL

HOURS

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE

OUR FEE:
Plus 7% PST

TOTAL FEES:

Minuk, Martin S. Partner 83.20 hrs.
Fotheringham, Kathleen BAssociate 2.00 hrs.
McNicol, Erin E. Associate 12.60 hrs.

Total Hours

97.80

3401.49



IN ACCQUNT WITH

AIKINS, MACAULAY & THORVALDSON LLP

BARRISTERS AND SOLICITCRS
TRADE-MARK AGENTS
30TH FLOOR COMMODITY EXCHANGE TOWER
360 MAIN STREET
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA RIC 4G}

TELEPHONE (24;937-0040

Manitoba Justice - Criminal Justice Division
510 - 405 Broadway November 30, 2007

Winnipeg, MB R3C 3L6
Attention: Brian Kaplan File No. 0501474
Invoice 498490

GST REGISTRATION NUMBER R121467575

RE: Zenk
Our File No: 0501474/MSM

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered from October 04, 2007 to and including
November 30, 2007 as follows:

DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS

04 Oct 07 Meeeting with B. Kaplan re MSM 2.00
file status

22 Oct 07 Meeting with B. Kaplan MSM 0.30

22 Oct 07 Review letter from R. Wolson MSM 0.10
to C.J. Wyant

22 Oct 07 Telephone call from R. Wolson MSM 0.20

29 Oct 07 Telephone calls with B. MSM 3.50

Slough and B. Kaplan, email
from and to D. Slough and
Deputy Minister re meetings
with victims, attend court on
sentencing, meeting with B.
Kaplan and D. Slough

30 Oct 07 Telephone calls with B. MSM 0.20
Kaplan, telephone call from D.
Slough
31 Oct 07 Meeting with M. Green MSM 2.00
01 Nov 07  Discussions with D. Slough MSM 5.00

and B. Kaplan, meeting with D.

“Service and Other Charges” are based on rates established by Aikins, MacAulay & Thorvaidson LLP and may change from time to (ime; in some cases they may exceed

amourus we pay to third panies. A schedule of these raies is available on request.
TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 47 OF THE LAW SOCIETY ACT OF MANITOBA, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 9% PER ANNUM
ON UNPAID FEES. CHARGES OR DISBURSEMENTS. CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT 1S ONE MONTH AFTER THIS STATEMENT IS DELIVERED.

3401.50




DATE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE INITIAL HOURS
Slough, B. Kaplan and R.
Perozzo, telephone call with
counsel
04 Nov 07  Meeting with M. Green MSM 1.50
05 Nov 07  Telephone calls with D, MSM 0.50
Slough and M. Green
29 Nov 07  Email from and to D. Slough MSM 0.20
re file materials
30 Nov 07  Organize and review file MSM 2.00
contents for return to MB-
Justice
Total Hours 17.50
OUR FEE:
Plus 7% PST
TOTAL FEES:
Minuk, Martin S. Partner 17.50 brs.

34M ;1



